
 
 
 
 
 

MSS – Pass Crossing 2012 
 

Regulations 
 
01. The purpose of the MSS Pass Crossing is to show the beauty of the Swiss Alps 
and less known spots of Switzerland to motorcyclists in a touristic competition. MSS 
awards points of defined Swiss mountain pass routes for each crossing during one 
season. This is the basis for the annual score. 
 
02. Entitled to participate are motorcyclists who own a road legal permitted 
motorbike, and they have to observe the road laws. The participation is at the 
participant's own risk and no liability can be assumed. 
 
03. After the payment of the entry fee, the registration is valid. Payment address: 
MotorMedia GmbH, Europastrasse 15, CH-8152 Glattbrugg, Credit Suisse, Zürich, 
Clearing 4835, IBAN CH20 0483 5076 6728 3100 0; notation: „MSS Pass Crossing“. 
After receipt of payment the participants receipt the necessary documents. You may 
also ask for a payment slip. 
 
04. Entry fees are: for MSS subscribers CHF 50.--; non-subscribers CHF 75.--. 
 
05. The scoring begins at March 17th and ends on November 3rd, 2012. During this 
period, participation is possible at any time. 
 
06. The selection of mountain passes also as the time of crossing are free.  
 
07. Only mountain passes which have been crossed in total can be scored (see list). 
Each mountain pass can be scored per tour and season only one time. 
 
08. On the top of a mountain pass, the crossing has to be documented by a photo. 
The photo has to show the place name sign, the hospice or a typical feature. In 
addition, your motorbike also as the front-page of the MSS issue 6/12 has to be 
shown on the picture. Download of the front-page MSS 6/12: www.motosport.ch 
also as the map and the list of the mountain passes (can also be taken out from the 
middle of issue 06/12). Please mark at each entry or on each photo the relevant 
mountain pass number. Note: we don’t set control or time cards at disposal any 
more. 
 
10. The awarding of scores follows the points according to the mountain pass list in 
the regulations. The points for each mountain pass you can find here: 
www.motosport.ch or www.motofun.ch under „MSS Pass Crossing“. Control cards 
for your Pass Crossing can be downloaded under: www.motofun.ch and/or 
www.motosport.ch. With this tools, you can document your crossed mountain passes 
by PC or manually very easily. 
 



11. The photos have to be sent until November 3rd, 2012 (date stamp) to: Hermann 
Ryter, Erlenstrasse 47 B, CH-3612 Steffisburg; notation: „MSS Pass Crossing“. At 
the same address, you may also ask for control cards. 
12. The awards will be given as follows: 
 
„Gold medal“ 24‘000 points and more 
„Silver medal“ 12‘000 to 23‘999 points 
„Bronze medal“ 6000 to 11‘999 points or 20 mountain passes at the minimum 
 
13. The award presentation ceremony will be held in the following year. The winners 
will be invited personally. 
 
14. These terms are subject to be changed at any time by the MSS-organising 
committee (head office: MotorMedia GmbH, MOTO SPORT SCHWEIZ, 
Europastrasse 15, CH-8152 Glattbrugg and by Hermann Ryter). 
 
15. In any questions contact Hermann Ryter, Erlenstrasse 47 B, 3612 Steffisburg, 
Phone: 033 437 81 04, Email: h.ryter@bluewin.ch or info@motofun.ch. 
 
 
CH-Glattbrugg, January 2012, the organising committee 


